
 
 
 

ADJUNCT LECTURER OF PSYCHOLOGY 
 
Wofford College invites applications for an adjunct lecturer in the Department of Psychology for fall 
2023 and spring 2024 to teach Introduction to Psychological Science. There is a lab associated with the 
course that uses a shared curriculum across sections. The lab requires data collection using Biopac, 
analysis and graphing using Excel, and APA style write-up on two projects. As is typical of small liberal 
arts colleges, our class size for labs has a maximum of 24 students. Given the small nature of our classes, 
our lectures tend to be interactive and include discussion. This is an ideal position for an ABD candidate 
interested in obtaining more extensive teaching experience to prepare for a career in academia, 
especially at a small liberal arts college. 
 
QUALIFICATIONS 
 
A master’s degree and one year of recent college-level teaching is required for appointment. A doctoral 
degree and more extensive teaching background is preferred. 
 
APPLICATION 
 
Application materials can be emailed to Dr. Cecile Nowatka (nowatkacm@wofford.edu). Application 
materials include: (1) a cover letter, (2) curriculum vitae, and (3) contact information for 2-3 references. 
Selected qualified candidates will be contacted for an interview (either in person or via Zoom) and 
teaching demonstration. Review of applications will begin immediately and will continue until the 
position is filled. 
 
ABOUT WOFFORD COLLEGE 
 
Wofford College is a place where thought leads, where ideas are celebrated and problem solving is 
expected. Wofford invites applicants who are focused on student success and excited to join a community 
committed to preparing thought leaders. 
 
Wofford College, established in 1854, is a four-year, residential liberal arts college located in 
Spartanburg, South Carolina. A Phi Beta Kappa college (chartered in 1940), Wofford offers 27 major 
fields of study to a student body of 1,800 undergraduates. Nationally known for the strength of its 
academic program, outstanding faculty, experiential learning opportunities and successful and 
supportive graduates, Wofford is recognized consistently as a “best value” and for accessibility for low- 
and middle-income students. To learn more, visit wofford.edu. 
 
EEO STATEMENT 
 
Wofford College values diversity within our students, faculty and staff and strives to recruit, develop and 
retain the most talented people. Wofford College does not discriminate in employment on the basis of 
race, color, creed, religion, sex, sexual orientation, transgender status, gender identity, age, national 



origin, disability, veteran status or any other legally protected status in accordance with applicable 
federal, state and local laws. For information about Wofford’s Title IX compliance, visit 
wofford.edu/administration/title-ix. 
 
It is the policy of Wofford College to provide reasonable accommodations for qualified individuals with 
disabilities for employment. If you require any accommodations to participate in any part of the hiring 
process, please contact HumanResources@Wofford.edu. 
 


